
Listening CLB 6 Speaking CLB 6 Reading CLB 6 Writing CLB 6

I can... I can... I can... I can...

CLB 6 at a Glance

•	Understand a friend or colleague 
cancelling plans 

•	Follow some safety steps in a 
workplace training video 

•	Understand a teacher's advice on 
how to improve my English 

•	Understand co-workers talking 
about what they need to do

•	Make a dentist appointment over 
the phone

•	Tell a classmate how to find online 
reference materials

•	Make a suggestion to improve 
safety in my workplace

•	Share my opinion at a small 
informal meeting

•	Read an e-mail from a friend 
cancelling a dinner date

•	Read and follow instructions for 
submitting a college application

•	Read a notice about construction 
in my neighbourhood

•	Read and compare health 
information from two different 
online sources

•	Write a message to a colleague to 
cancel plans

•	Take notes in class to share with 
my classmate

•	Write an e-mail to ask for a refund 
for a product that did not work

•	Write two paragraphs to describe 
a familiar sequence of events

I am beginning to understand 
communication that includes 
some abstract ideas. But, I don’t 
understand everything when the 
communication is complex. The 
speaker needs to speak clearly 
at a slow-to-normal pace, and I 
may still need some repetition, 
especially over the phone.

I communicate with some 
confidence in routine situations, 
and am starting to develop some 
control of more complex grammar. 
But I make some hesitations, and 
my mistakes in grammar and 
pronunciation may sometimes 
make it hard for people to 
understand me.

I understand predictable reading 
materials on topics that are 
relevant to me. But I cannot 
understand when the vocabulary 
and structures are complex.

I can write short communications 
on routine familiar topics, and am 
starting to develop some control of 
more complex grammar. But, I still 
make mistakes and use awkward 
word combinations. I don't always 
use the right type of language for 
the situation.




